

County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House
195 Arsenal Street
Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077
Fax: 315-785-7591



Email Addresses:

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us
amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Buyers
Karin Dorr
Amanda McCracken

Director
Mark Sachetti
NIGP-CPP, CPPB

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore
Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

OCTOBER 31, 2023

**ATTN: GARY MCLEAN JR
ANDERSON EQUIPMENT COMPANY
22607 MURROCK CIRCLE
WATERTOWN NY 13601**

**BID # 2023F-12a NAME: ROAD AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT PARTS AND LABOR
DYNA PAC, KOMATSU, SALSCO**

CONTRACT PERIOD: NOVEMBER 1, 2023 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2024

Dear Mr. McLean:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are enclosed or pending:

√ Purchase Order to be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director
MS/kd

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Alta Construction Equipment Co, Conway Beam Truck Group, Milton Cat, United Construction & Forestry, Copenhagen Carvers dba Burrville Power Equipment, McQuade & Bannigan, J & J Equipment LLC, Baschmann Services, Tracey Road Equipment Inc, Empire Tractor

County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House
195 Arsenal Street
Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077
Fax: 315-785-7591



Email Addresses:

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us
amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Buyers
Karin Dorr
Amanda McCracken

Director
Mark Sachetti
NIGP-CPP, CPPB

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore
Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

OCTOBER 31, 2023

ATTN PATRICIA LAPAGLIA
CONWAY BEAM TRUCK GROUP
22048 SALMON RUN MALL ROAD
WATERTOWN NY 13601

BID #2023F-12a NAME: ROAD AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT PARTS AND LABOR -
MACK AND VOLVO TRUCKS

CONTRACT PERIOD: NOVEMBER 1, 2023 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2024

Dear Ms. LaPaglia:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are pending:

√ Purchase Order to be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director
MS/ag

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Anderson Equipment, Alta Construction Equipment Co, Milton Cat, United Construction & Forestry, Copenhagen Carvers dba Burrville Power Equipment, McQuade & Bannigan, J & J Equipment LLC, Baschmann Services, Tracey Road Equipment Inc, Empire Tractor

County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House
195 Arsenal Street
Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077
Fax: 315-785-7591



Email Addresses:

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us
amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Buyers
Karin Dorr
Amanda McCracken

Director
Mark Sachetti
NIGP-CPP, CPPB

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore
Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

OCTOBER 31, 2023

ATTN JARED UTZ
MILTON CAT
294 AINSLEY DRIVE
SYRACUSE NY 13210

BID # 2023F-12a

NAME: ROAD AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT PARTS AND LABOR -
CATERPILLAR

CONTRACT PERIOD: NOVEMBER 1, 2023 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2024

Dear Mr. Utz:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are enclosed or pending:

√ Purchase Order to be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director
MS/kd

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Anderson Equipment, Conway Beam Truck Group, Alta Construction Equipment Co, United Construction & Forestry, Copenhagen Carvers dba Burrville Power Equipment, McQuade & Bannigan, J & J Equipment LLC, Baschmann Services, Tracey Road Equipment Inc, Empire Tractor

County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House
195 Arsenal Street
Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077
Fax: 315-785-7591



Email Addresses:

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us
amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Buyers
Karin Dorr
Amanda McCracken

Director
Mark Sachetti
NIGP-CPP, CPPB

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore
Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

OCTOBER 31, 2023

ATTN JAMIE KLINGER
ALTA CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT CO
5965 COURT ST ROAD
SYRACUSE NY 13206

BID # 2023F-12a NAME: ROAD AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT PARTS AND LABOR
BLAW KNOX, GRADALL

CONTRACT PERIOD: NOVEMBER 1, 2023 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2024

Dear Mr. Klinger:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are pending:

√ Purchase Order to be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director
MS/kd

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Anderson Equipment, Conway Beam Truck Group, Milton Cat, United Construction & Forestry, Copenhagen Carvers dba Burrville Power Equipment, McQuade & Bannigan, J & J Equipment LLC, Baschmann Services, Tracey Road Equipment Inc, Empire Tractor

County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House
195 Arsenal Street
Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077
Fax: 315-785-7591



Email Addresses:

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us
amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Buyers
Karin Dorr
Amanda McCracken

Director
Mark Sachetti
NIGP-CPP, CPPB

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore
Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

OCTOBER 31, 2023

**ATTN: DAVID WALTERS
UNITED CONSTRUCTION & FORESTRY LLC
1486 US HIGHWAY 11
GOUVERNEUR NY 13642**

**BID #2023F-12a NAME: ROAD AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT PARTS AND LABOR –
JOHN DEERE- CONSTRUCTION**

CONTRACT PERIOD: NOVEMBER 1, 2023 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2024

DEAR MR. WALTERS:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are pending:

✓ Purchase Order to be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director
MS/kd

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Anderson Equipment, Conway Beam Truck Group, Milton Cat, Alta Construction Equipment Co, Copenhagen Carvers dba Burrville Power Equipment, McQuade & Bannigan, J & J Equipment LLC, Baschmann Services, Tracey Road Equipment Inc, Empire Tractor

County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House
195 Arsenal Street
Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077
Fax: 315-785-7591



Email Addresses:

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us
amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Buyers
Karin Dorr
Amanda McCracken

Director
Mark Sachetti
NIGP-CPP, CPPB

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore
Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

OCTOBER 31, 2023

ATTN SCOTT SIMMONS
COPENHAGEN CARVERS LLC
DbA BURRVILLE POWER EQUIPMENT
25371 ROUTE 12S
WATERTOWN NY 13601

BID #2023F-12a NAME: ROAD AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT PARTS AND LABOR –
CASE AGRICULTURE, LANDPRIDE, NEW HOLLAND AGRICULTURE, NEW HOLLAND
CONSTRUCTION, TIGER MOWERS, WACKER, WOODS

CONTRACT PERIOD: NOVEMBER 1, 2023 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2024

DEAR MR. SIMMONS:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

The following documents are required before a Contract/Purchase Order is issued:

- ✓ Insurance Certificate - Commercial General Liability, Business Automobile Liability
- ✓ Proof of New York State Disability/Worker's Compensation
- ✓ Other: Please note that Jefferson County must be listed on your Insurance certificates as an additional insured as noted in the bid document under Insurance Requirements.

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director
MS/kd

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Anderson Equipment, Conway Beam Truck Group, Alta Construction Equipment Co, United Construction & Forestry, Milton Cat, McQuade & Bannigan, J & J Equipment LLC, Baschmann Services, Tracey Road Equipment Inc, Empire Tractor

County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House
195 Arsenal Street
Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077
Fax: 315-785-7591



Email Addresses:

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us
amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Buyers
Karin Dorr
Amanda McCracken

Director
Mark Sachetti
NIGP-CPP, CPPB

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore
Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

OCTOBER 31, 2023

ATTN ROBERT SARTWELL
MCQUADE & BANNIGAN
22696 MURROCK CIRCLE
WATERTOWN NY 13601

BID #2023F-12a NAME: ROAD AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT PARTS AND LABOR –
ALLMAND GENERATORS

CONTRACT PERIOD: NOVEMBER 1, 2023 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2024

DEAR MR. SARTWELL:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

The following documents are required before a Contract/Purchase Order is issued:

- ✓ Insurance Certificate - Commercial General Liability, Business Automobile Liability
- ✓ Proof of New York State Disability/Worker's Compensation
- ✓ Other: Please note that Jefferson County must be listed on your Insurance certificates as an additional insured as noted in the bid document under Insurance Requirements.

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director
MS/kd

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Anderson Equipment, Conway Beam Truck Group, Alta Construction Equipment Co, United Construction & Forestry, Milton Cat, Copenhagen Carvers LLC dba Burrville Power Equipment, J & J Equipment LLC, Baschmann Services, Tracey Road Equipment Inc, Empire Tractor

County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House
195 Arsenal Street
Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077
Fax: 315-785-7591



Email Addresses:

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us
amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Buyers
Karin Dorr
Amanda McCracken

Director
Mark Sachetti
NIGP-CPP, CPPB

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore
Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

OCTOBER 31, 2023

**ATTN GEORGE LONERGAN
J & J EQUIPMENT LLC
8913 TEREX DRIVE
BREWERTON NY 13029**

**BID #2023F-12a NAME: ROAD AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT PARTS AND LABOR –
TYMCO**

CONTRACT PERIOD: NOVEMBER 1, 2023 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2024

DEAR MR. LONERGAN:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

The following documents are required before a Contract/Purchase Order is issued:

- ✓ Insurance Certificate - Commercial General Liability, Business Automobile Liability
- ✓ Proof of New York State Disability/Worker's Compensation
- ✓ Other: Please note that Jefferson County must be listed on your Insurance certificates as an additional insured as noted in the bid document under Insurance Requirements.

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director
MS/kd

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Anderson Equipment, Conway Beam Truck Group, Alta Construction Equipment Co, United Construction & Forestry, Milton Cat, Copenhagen Carvers LLC dba Burrville Power Equipment, McQuade & Bannigan, Baschmann Services, Tracey Road Equipment Inc, Empire Tractor

County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House
195 Arsenal Street
Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077
Fax: 315-785-7591



Email Addresses:

marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us
amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Buyers
Karin Dorr
Amanda McCracken

Director
Mark Sachetti
NIGP-CPP, CPPB

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore
Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

OCTOBER 31, 2023

ATTN ROBERT TRACY
BASCHMANN SERVICES
1101 MAPLE ROAD
ELMA NY 14059

BID #2023F-12a NAME: ROAD AND MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT PARTS AND LABOR –
CARLTON

CONTRACT PERIOD: NOVEMBER 1, 2023 THROUGH OCTOBER 31, 2024

DEAR MR. TRACY:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

The following documents are required before a Contract/Purchase Order is issued:

- ✓ Insurance Certificate - Commercial General Liability, Business Automobile Liability
- ✓ Proof of New York State Disability/Worker's Compensation
- ✓ Other: Please note that Jefferson County must be listed on your Insurance certificates as an additional insured as noted in the bid document under Insurance Requirements.

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director
MS/kd

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Anderson Equipment, Conway Beam Truck Group, Alta Construction Equipment Co, United Construction & Forestry, Milton Cat, Copenhagen Carvers LLC dba Burrville Power Equipment, McQuade & Bannigan, J & J Equipment LLC, Tracey Road Equipment Inc, Empire Tractor

BID #2023F-12a
ROAD MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT PARTS AND LABOR
BID TABULATION
11/1/23 - 10/31/24

	TRACEY ROAD EQUIPMENT INC	EMPIRE TRACTOR	ANDERSON EQUIPMENT COMPANY	CONWAY BEAM TRUCK GROUP	MILTON CAT	ALTA EQUIPMENT CO Was Vantage Equipment	UNITED CONSTRUCTION & FORESTRY Was Nortrax	COPENHAGEN CARVERS LLC dba BURRVILLE POWER EQUIPMENT	MCQUADE & BANNIGAN	J & J EQUIPMENT LLC	BASCHMANN SERVICES
	FOR THE PERIOD 11/1/23 - 10/31/24	FOR THE PERIOD 11/1/23 - 10/31/24	FOR THE PERIOD 11/1/23 - 10/31/24	FOR THE PERIOD 11/1/23 - 10/31/24	FOR THE PERIOD 11/1/23 - 10/31/24	FOR THE PERIOD 11/1/23 - 10/31/24	FOR THE PERIOD 11/1/23 - 10/31/24	FOR THE PERIOD 11/1/23 - 10/31/24	FOR THE PERIOD 11/1/23 - 10/31/24	FOR THE PERIOD 11/1/23 - 10/31/24	FOR THE PERIOD 11/1/23 - 10/31/24
ITEM #2	ALLMAND GENERATOR										
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST								10%	10%		
LABOR RATE \$ _____/HR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$70.00/HR	NO BID	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$ _____/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	N/A	NO BID	NO BID
ITEM #4:	BLAW KNOX										
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	0%	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
LABOR RATE \$ _____/HR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$160.00/NR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$ _____/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.00/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ITEM #4a:	CARLTON (STUMP GRINDER)										
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	10%	NO BID	NO BID	15%
LABOR RATE \$ _____/HR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$125.00/HR	NO BID	NO BID	\$145.00/HR
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$ _____/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.00/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.75/MILE
ITEM #7	CASE - AGRICULTURE										
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	10%	5%	NO BID	NO BID
LABOR RATE \$ _____/HR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$ _____/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ITEM #8:	CATERPILLAR										
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	0%	NO BID	NO BID	10%	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
LABOR RATE \$ _____/HR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Earthmoving Shop R/T \$171/HR O/T \$231/HR P/T \$267/HR - Earthmoving Field R/T \$184/HR O/T \$239/HR P/T \$276/HR - Travel R/T \$137/HR O/T \$178/HR P/T \$206/HR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$ _____/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.25/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ITEM #10:	DYNA PAC										
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	NO BID	0%	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
LABOR RATE \$ _____/HR	NO BID	NO BID	\$145/HR SHOP \$151/HR ROAD	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$ _____/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.25/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ITEM #12:	GRADALL										
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	0%	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
LABOR RATE \$ _____/HR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$160.00/NR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$ _____/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.00/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ITEM #17:	JOHN DEERE - CONSTRUCTION										
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	0%	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
LABOR RATE \$ _____/HR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$195.00/HR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$ _____/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.25/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ITEM #18:	KOMATSU										
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	NO BID	0%	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
LABOR RATE \$ _____/HR	NO BID	NO BID	\$145/HR SHOP \$151/HR ROAD	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$ _____/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.25/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ITEM #19:	LAND PRIDE										
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	0%	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	10%	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
LABOR RATE \$ _____/HR	NO BID	\$140.00/HR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$125.00/HR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$ _____/MILE	NO BID	\$150.00/HR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.00/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ITEM #20:	LEROI										
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
LABOR RATE \$ _____/HR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$ _____/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ITEM #21:	MACK										
PARTS DISCOUNT FROM MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
LABOR RATE \$ _____/HR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$140.00/HR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ROAD SERVICE RATE \$ _____/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.00/MILE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

